
CAMBRIDGESHIRE 
WEDDING VENUE  
FOR HIRE

WYSING ARTS CENTRE 



Exclusively, for  only  a  few  weekends  a  year, 
Wysing Arts Centre is available to hire as a 
unique wedding venue. 

Set in rural Cambridgeshire, the 11-acre 
grounds feature inspirational sculptures and a 
range of unique buildings well suited to a 
festival style wedding event.



Grade II Listed Farmhouse with room to 
sleep11 people in the wedding party

The Live/Work Studio  a studio apartment and 
a perfect private space for the wedding couple

Unique Settings for Ceramonies including  
Amphis (2008) a unique patchwork buildling 
made by Folke Köbberling and Martin 
Kaltwasser, and Double Spiral (1998) by Christine 
Fox, located within woodland

The Gallery a large space, converted from a 
former hay shed that can seat up to 80 guests 
banquet style

Reception a welcoming space great for 
refreshments and live music

Professional Kitchen  for caterers to use

Plenty of Open Space for food vans, 
performances and camping

On site car parking for up to 25 vehicles plus 2 
accessible parking bays

The site is offered on a ‘dry hire’ basis, for you 
to arrange your own venue dressing, caterers, 
performers and staffing. Prices are agreed on a 
case by case basis. 

mailto:info@wysingartscentre.org
http://www.wysingartscentre.org/about/space_hire
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Amy Rose Photography 

www.amy-rose.co.uk 

Mike Cameron Photography 
www.michaelcameronphotography.co.uk

Tom Halliday Photography  
www.tomhalliday.com

Wedding styling: www.allthingsconsideredevents.co.uk 

Flowers: www.wildrosamund.co.uk

Cake: www.cakesandleaves.com

Hair and make up: www.shadesofbeautyessex.co.uk

Suit: www.vintagesuithire.co.uk

Dress: www.rockthefrockbridal.co.uk/pages/rtf-preloved-

essex 

http://www.amy-rose.co.uk
http://www.michaelcameronphotography.co.uk
http://www.allthingsconsideredevents.co.uk
http://www.shadesofbeautyessex.co.uk
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For more information contact us on: 
info@wysingartscentre.org  
Tel 01954 718 881

Wysing Arts Centre 
Fox Road, Bourn 
Cambridgeshire CB23 2TX 

www.wysingartscentre.org/about/
space_hire
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